From: Scott Fulton

To: Jack Kuntzman
Subject: Fwd: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd
Date: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:23:59 PM

FYI. Please print one and save in both files

Get Outlook for Android

From: Scott Fulton

Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:23:06 PM

To: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>
Subject: Re: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd

Will do. Thanks

Get Outlook for Android

From: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>
Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:22:33 PM

To: Scott Fulton <sfulton@ci.pataskala.oh.us>

Subject: RE: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd

Withdraw it.

From: Scott Fulton <sfulton@ci.pataskala.oh.us>

Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:22 PM

To: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>
Subject: Re: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd

Jeff,

| don't believe the board will table it for five years. If that is your time frame, you will likely
need to withdraw your application.

Thanks,
Scott

Get Outlook for Android

From: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>
Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:18:28 PM

To: Scott Fulton <sfulton@ci.pataskala.oh.us>

Subject: RE: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd
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I hate to forfeit all the fees and studies that we have paid for. For instance will
the ODOT study transfer with the sale of the property?

If we pursue this again in 5 years will we be paying for another fire department
study?

Would we be paying another fee to restart this project?

Jeff

From: Scott Fulton <sfulton@ci.pataskala.oh.us>

Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:15 PM

To: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>; Jack Kuntzman
<jkuntzman@ci.pataskala.oh.us>

Cc: Jason Williamson <jtwilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>
Subject: Re: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd

Jeff,

Do you want to table the application or withdraw it?
Thanks,

Scott

Get Outlook for Android

From: Jeff Williamson <JWilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>

Sent: Monday, August 12, 2019 2:11:20 PM

To: Scott Fulton <sfulton@ci.pataskala.oh.us>; Jack Kuntzman <jkuntzman@ci.pataskala.oh.us>
Cc: Jason Williamson <jtwilliamson@williamsoninsurance.net>

Subject: Williamson Insurance 7856 Hazelton Etna Rd

Gentlemen,

You can remove us for the upcoming agenda. We are putting the project on
hold indefinitely.

Jeff
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DISCLAIMER:

The information contained in this message may be privileged or confidential and is protected from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the
intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us
immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.




